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Billy Owens

From: Emily Beckham <EBeckham@nctcog.org>
Sent: Thursday, January 10, 2019 7:11 PM
To: Billy Owens
Cc: Amanda Townsend; Ashley Releford; Lori Clark; Amy Hodges
Subject: RE: Agreement for Execution - Clean Fleets N. Texas (TRN5077)
Attachments: Procurement Pre-Approval: N. Richland Hills purchase from Siddon-Martin Emergency 

Group

Importance: High

Billy,  
I did want to loop back on this item. Even though you all have procurement approval, this approval is contingent upon 
full execution of the agreement. Execution of the agreement is authorization of the project to proceed. If you all initiate 
purchase of the fire trucks, without execution of the agreement those expenses are ineligible.  
 
Do you all have an update on your signature of the agreement?  
 

_______________________________________ 
Emily R. Beckham 
Grants and Contracts Manager 
North Central Texas Council of Governments 
616 Six Flags Drive, Suite 200, Centerpoint Two 
Arlington, TX 76011 
Phone: 817-608-2308 
ebeckham@nctcog.org  
 
Find us on social media 

               NCTCOGtrans 

 

 

From: Billy Owens <bowens@nrhtx.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, January 9, 2019 10:13 AM 
To: Emily Beckham <EBeckham@nctcog.org> 
Cc: Amanda Townsend <atownsend@nrhtx.com>; Ashley Releford <AReleford@nctcog.org>; Lori Clark 
<LClark@nctcog.org>; Amy Hodges <AHodges@nctcog.org> 
Subject: RE: Agreement for Execution ‐ Clean Fleets N. Texas (TRN5077) 
 
Emily, 
 
I have forwarded your response to our city attorney. We appreciate your assistance with our accelerated timeline!  
 
Thank you, 
 
Billy Owens 
Emergency Management Coordinator 
City of North Richland Hills 
(O)  817‐427‐6935 
(M) 972‐989‐3686 
bowens@nrhtx.com 
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From: Emily Beckham <EBeckham@nctcog.org>  
Sent: Tuesday, January 08, 2019 6:41 PM 
To: Billy Owens <bowens@nrhtx.com> 
Cc: Amanda Townsend <atownsend@nrhtx.com>; Ashley Releford <AReleford@nctcog.org>; Lori Clark 
<LClark@nctcog.org>; Amy Hodges <AHodges@nctcog.org> 
Subject: RE: Agreement for Execution ‐ Clean Fleets N. Texas (TRN5077) 
 
Billy,  
In coordinating with our attorney, since this project is straight forward (one purchase, one reimbursement) we’d like to 
leave the time for curing of defects at 10 days (Article 2.10). We are OK with the updates/revisions in Article 
10.1.  Attached is a redline version with those changes/comments notated. Additionally, I’ve attached a revised final 
version via PDF for the City to sign. This replaces previous version provided to the City on December 11, 2018 for 
signature.  
 
Please do not hesitate to let me know if there are any questions or additional updates needed.   
 
Respectfully,  

_______________________________________ 
Emily R. Beckham 
Grants and Contracts Manager 
North Central Texas Council of Governments 
616 Six Flags Drive, Suite 200, Centerpoint Two 
Arlington, TX 76011 
Phone: 817-608-2308 
ebeckham@nctcog.org  
 
Find us on social media 

               NCTCOGtrans 

 

 

From: Billy Owens <bowens@nrhtx.com>  
Sent: Friday, January 4, 2019 2:29 PM 
To: Emily Beckham <EBeckham@nctcog.org> 
Subject: FW: Agreement for Execution ‐ Clean Fleets N. Texas (TRN5077) 
 
Emily, 
 
Here is the other document I was referencing. You said you would need to review it with your attorneys at COG.  
 
Billy Owens 
Emergency Management Coordinator 
City of North Richland Hills 
(O)  817‐427‐6935 
(M) 972‐989‐3686 
bowens@nrhtx.com 

 

From: Billy Owens  
Sent: Thursday, December 20, 2018 2:51 PM 
To: 'Emily Beckham' <EBeckham@nctcog.org> 
Cc: Lori Clark <LClark@nctcog.org>; Amy Hodges <AHodges@nctcog.org>; Ashley Releford <AReleford@nctcog.org>; 



3

Amanda Townsend <atownsend@nrhtx.com> 
Subject: RE: Agreement for Execution ‐ Clean Fleets N. Texas (TRN5077) 
 
Emily, 
 
Our city attorney had a couple changes to the document. 
 
Section 2.10 – See change 
Section 10.1 – See change 
 
Also, we have an accelerated timeline for our vehicle purchase because of a price increase scheduled to happen on 
February 1, 2019. We are planning to purchase the new fire engine in January through a Buyboard contact. We are 
currently working on that quote with the apparatus vendor to make sure everything is good to go. What needs to 
happen on the COG side of things to make sure we can purchase our new vehicle and be approved by the COG in 
January? 
 
Billy Owens 
Emergency Management Coordinator 
City of North Richland Hills 
(O) 817‐427‐6935 
(M) 972‐989‐3686 
bowens@nrhtx.com 

 

From: Emily Beckham  
Sent: Tuesday, December 11, 2018 11:52 AM 
To: Billy Owens  
Cc: Lori Clark ; Amy Hodges ; Ashley Releford  
Subject: Agreement for Execution ‐ Clean Fleets N. Texas (TRN5077) 
 
Billy,  
Please find attached the agreement between the North Central Texas Council of Governments and North Richland Hills 
for the Clean Fleets North Texas 2018 Call for Projects for signature. Instructions for execution are included in the 
attached transmittal. Please do not hesitate to reach me at the contact information below if there are any questions.  
 
Respectfully,  

_______________________________________ 
Emily R. Beckham 
Grants and Contracts Manager 
North Central Texas Council of Governments 
616 Six Flags Drive, Suite 200, Centerpoint Two 
Arlington, TX 76011 
Phone: 817-608-2308 
ebeckham@nctcog.org  
 
Find us on social media 

NCTCOGtrans 

 

 


