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May 4, 2021 

Sent Via Email: jskaggs@vectorconcepts.com

Jody Skaggs
Vector Concepts, Inc.
9010 N. Royal Lane, Suite 110
Irving, TX 75063

Welcome to BuyBoard! 

Re:   N   otice of The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative Contract Award; Proposal Invitation No. 
642-21, Carpet and Tile Flooring, Stage Floor Finishing, Concrete Polishing, Grinding and Staining

Congratulations, The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative (Cooperative) has awarded 
your company a BuyBoard® contract based on the above-referenced Proposal Invitation. The 
contract is effective for an initial one-year term of June 1, 2021 through May 31, 2022 and may be 
subject to two possible one-year renewals. Please refer to the Proposal Invitation for the contract 
documents, including the General Terms and Conditions of the Contract. 

To review the items your company has been awarded, please review Proposal Tabulation No. 642-21 at: 
www.buyboard.com/vendor. Only items marked as awarded to your company are included in this contract 
award, and only those awarded items may be sold through the BuyBoard contract.  All sales must comply 
with the contract terms and must be at or below the awarded pricing as set forth in the General Terms and 
Conditions.  

The contract will be posted on the BuyBoard website as an online electronic catalog(s). You are 
reminded that, in accordance with the General Terms and Conditions, all purchase 
orders must be processed through the BuyBoard. Except as expressly authorized in writing 
by the Cooperative’s administrator, you are not authorized to process a purchase order received 
directly from a Cooperative member that has not been processed through the BuyBoard or provided to 
the Cooperative. If you receive a purchase order directly from a Cooperative member that you have reason 
to believe has not been received by the Cooperative or processed through the BuyBoard, you must 
promptly forward a copy of the purchase order by email to info@buyboard.com. 

A list of Cooperative members is available on the buyboard.com website. The BuyBoard vendor relations 
staff will be contacting you to assist with the resources available and to provide any support you may need 
as an awarded BuyBoard vendor. 

On behalf of the Cooperative, we appreciate your interest in the Cooperative and we are looking forward 
to your participation in the program. If you have any questions, please contact Cooperative 
Procurement Staff at 800‐695‐2919 (select option “2”). 

Sincerely, 

Arturo Salinas 
Asst. Division Director, Cooperative Purchasing 
Texas Association of School Boards, Inc.,  
Administrator for The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative 

mailto:info@buyboard.com
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May 4, 2021 
 
Sent Via Email: jskaggs@vectorconcepts.com 
 
Jody Skaggs 
Vector Concepts, Inc. 
9010 N. Royal Lane, Suite 110 
Irving, TX 75063 
 
Welcome to BuyBoard! 
Re:  Notice of National Purchasing Cooperative Award; Proposal Invitation No. 642-21, Carpet and Tile Flooring, Stage Floor 
Finishing, Concrete Polishing, Grinding and Staining 
 
Congratulations, The National Purchasing Cooperative (National Cooperative) has awarded your company a BuyBoard® 
contract based on the above-referenced Proposal Invitation.  The contract is effective for an initial one-year term of June 1, 
2021 through May 31, 2022, and may be subject to two possible one-year renewals.  Please refer to the Proposal Invitation 
for the contract documents, including the National Purchasing Cooperative Vendor Award Agreement and General Terms and 
Conditions of the Contract. 
 
To review the items your company has been awarded, please review Proposal Tabulation No. 642-21 at 
www.buyboard.com/vendor. Only items marked as awarded to your company are included in this contract award, and only 
those awarded items may be sold through the BuyBoard contract. All sales must comply with the contract terms and must 
be at or below the awarded pricing as set forth in the General Terms and Conditions.      
 
The contract will be posted on the BuyBoard website as an online electronic catalog(s). You are reminded that, in 
accordance with the General Terms and Conditions, all purchase orders from National Cooperative members 
must be processed through the BuyBoard. Except as expressly authorized in writing by the Cooperative’s administrator, 
you are not authorized to process a purchase order received directly from a National Cooperative member that has not been 
processed through the BuyBoard or provided to the Cooperative. If you receive a purchase order directly from a National 
Cooperative member that you have reason to believe has not been received by the National Cooperative or processed through 
the BuyBoard, you must promptly forward a copy of the purchase order by e-mail to info@buyboard.com 
 
A list of National Cooperative members is available on the buyboard.com website. The BuyBoard vendor relations staff will 
be contacting you to assist with resources available and provide any support you may need as an awarded BuyBoard vendor. 
 
On behalf of the National Cooperative, we are looking forward to your participation in the program.  If you have any questions, 
please contact Cooperative Procurement Staff at 800-695-2919 (select option “2”). 
 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Arturo Salinas, Asst. Division Director, Cooperative Purchasing 
Texas Association of School Boards, Inc.,  
Procurement Administrator for the National Purchasing Cooperative 

http://www.buyboard.com/vendor
















































































642-21 Addendum 1

VECTOR CONCEPTS, INC

Supplier Response

Event Information

Number: 642-21 Addendum 1
Title: Carpet and Tile Flooring, Stage Floor Refinishing, Concrete Polishing,

Grinding and Staining
Type: Request for Proposal
Issue Date: 9/15/2020
Deadline: 11/19/2020 04:00 PM (CT)
Notes:

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative (BuyBoard)

 

Proposal Invitation No. 642-21

Carpet and Tile Flooring, Stage Floor Refinishing, Concrete Polishing, Grinding and

Staining

Proposal Due Date and Time: November 19, 2020 at 4:00 PM

 

Responding to this and future proposals online is easy with our online submission system.

1. View and download the forms.

DO NOT log in to view and download the documents.

Visit vendor.buyboard.com and click on the “Current Proposal Invitations” button 

shown below to view and download the forms for this proposal.
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    2. To submit completed proposal.

Visit vendor.buyboard.com and click "Register/Login/Submit Proposal" button shown 

below to submit your proposal online.

 

For additional assistance click this link è View our Proposal Submission Instructions.

 

New Vendor? Visit vendor.buyboard.com and click “Register/Login/Submit Proposal.” 

Click Register now as a new supplier/vendor, so you don’t miss future proposal opportunities.

 

Any Addenda issued with this proposal will also be placed on the website, and it will be the 

vendor’s responsibility to obtain the information.
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VECTOR CONCEPTS, INC Information

Contact: JODY SKAGGS
Address: 9010 N Royal Land #110

Irving, TX 75063
Phone: (972) 313-3129 x229
Email: jody@vectorconcepts.com

By submitting your response, you certify that you are authorized to represent and bind your company.

JODY SKAGGS jody@vectorconcepts.com
Signature Email

Submitted at 11/19/2020 12:55:09 PM

Requested Attachments

BuyBoard Proposal Invitation No. 642-21 Carpet and Tile Flooring,
Stage Floor Refinishing, Concrete Polishing, Grinding and Staining

642-21 - Carpet & Tile Flooring.pdf

REQUIRED - In PDF format, upload all proposal invitation documents available for download at vendor.buyboard.com
including any additional pages, as necessary. (Please DO NOT password protect uploaded files.)

Catalog/Pricelist 642-21 Price List.pdf

REQUIRED - In PDF format, upload catalog/pricelist in proposal invitation instructions. File size must not exceed
100MB.(Please DO NOT password protect uploaded files.)

Manufacturer Authorization Letter(s) 642-21 MFG Authorization Letters.pdf

REQUIRED - Upload Manufacturer Authorization Letter(s)in PDF format. Manufacturers responding to this proposal
invitation, in lieu of an authorization letter, must submit a response on company letterhead explaining that the
company is a manufacturer of products proposed. Dealers responding to this Proposal Invitation should submit an
approval letter from each manufacturer or a response on company letterhead explaining that the company is not
required to submit an authorization letter.

IRS Form W-9 Request for Taxpayer Identification Number and Certification W-9 2020.pdf

REQUIRED - In PDF format, upload W-9 form. (Please DO NOT password protect uploaded files.)

Detailed Information and Exceptions
Related to Services

Detailed Information and Exceptions Related to Services 642-21.pdf

In PDF format, define the services that are proposed to be provided and attach detailed information including
exceptions to pricing or discount percentage, NOTE: IF DETAILED INFORMATION IS NOT SUBMITTED, PROPOSAL
WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED. (Please DO NOT password protect uploaded files.)

Addendum No. 1 Addendum 1 - Carpet.pdf

REQUIRED - In PDF format, upload addendum document available for download at vendor.buyboard.com including
any additional pages, as necessary. (Please DO NOT password protect uploaded files.)

Bid Lines
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1
Section I: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for All Carpet
Products (Indoor and Outdoor). Catalog/Pricelist MUST be included or proposal will not be considered.

 Total: 25%

Item Notes:

Vendors proposing various manufacturer product lines per line item must submit the information as
follows or proposal may not be considered:

Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each Manufacturer listed.

Additional/Alternate Manufacturer lines must submitted by selecting "Add Alternate".

For manufacturer's that sell direct, the Cooperative will only consider proposal responses from
the manufacturer.

For manufacturers that sell through a dealer network, the Cooperative will only consider proposal
responses from dealers with written documentation from the manufacturer authorizing the dealer
to submit on their behalf.

Manufacturers responding to this Proposal Invitation must provide a list of all approved installers.

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

J&J FLOORING

Alternate 1

Section I: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for All Carpet
Products (Indoor and Outdoor). Catalog/Pricelist MUST be included or proposal will not be considered.

 Total: 25%

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

MILLIKEN
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2
Section I: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for All Tile
Products-vinyl, ceramic, and related floor tile products (Indoor and Outdoor). Catalog/Pricelist MUST be
submitted or proposal will not be considered.

 Total: 25%

Item Notes:

Vendors proposing various manufacturer product lines per line item must submit the information as
follows or proposal may not be considered:

Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each Manufacturer listed.

Additional/Alternate Manufacturer lines must submitted by selecting "Add Alternate".

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

Gerflor Flooring Group

3
Section I: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for All Cove Base
and Stair Tread Floor Products. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be submitted or proposal will not be considered.

 Total: 25%

Item Notes:

Vendors proposing various manufacturer product lines per line item must submit the information as
follows or proposal may not be considered:

Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each Manufacturer listed.

Additional/Alternate Manufacturer lines must submitted by selecting "Add Alternate".

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

ROPPE
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4
Section I: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for All Terrazzo
Flooring Products. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be submitted or proposal will not be considered.

 No Bid

Item Notes:

Vendors proposing various manufacturer product lines per line item must submit the information as
follows or proposal may not be considered:

Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each Manufacturer listed.

Additional/Alternate Manufacturer lines must submitted by selecting "Add Alternate".

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

No response

5
Section I: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for All
Performance Stage (Dance, Performing Arts, and Entertainment) Flooring Products. Catalog/Pricelist
MUST be submitted or proposal will not be considered.

 Total: 25%

Item Notes:

Vendors proposing various manufacturer product lines per line item must submit the information as
follows or proposal may not be considered:

Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each Manufacturer listed.

Additional/Alternate Manufacturer lines must submitted by selecting "Add Alternate".

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

Gerflor Flooring Group
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6
Section I: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Concrete
Polishing, Grinding and Sealing Flooring Products. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be submitted or proposal will not
be considered.

 No Bid

Item Notes:

Vendors proposing various manufacturer product lines per line item must submit the information as
follows or proposal may not be considered:

Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each Manufacturer listed.

Additional/Alternate Manufacturer lines must submitted by selecting "Add Alternate".

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

No response

7
Section I: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Acid Stain/Dye
Flooring Products. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be submitted or proposal will not be considered.

 No Bid

Item Notes:

Vendors proposing various manufacturer product lines per line item must submit the information as
follows or proposal may not be considered:

Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each Manufacturer listed.

Additional/Alternate Manufacturer lines must submitted by selecting "Add Alternate".

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

No response
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8
Section I: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Joint Filler and
Sealant Floor Products. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be submitted or proposal will not be considered.

 No Bid

Item Notes:

Vendors proposing various manufacturer product lines per line item must submit the information as
follows or proposal may not be considered:

Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each Manufacturer listed.

Additional/Alternate Manufacturer lines must submitted by selecting "Add Alternate".

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

No response

9
Section I: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for All Other Floor
Products and Floor Prep Supplies. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be submitted or proposal will not be considered.

 Total: 25%

Item Notes:

Vendors proposing various manufacturer product lines per line item must submit the information as
follows or proposal may not be considered:

Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each Manufacturer listed.

Additional/Alternate Manufacturer lines must submitted by selecting "Add Alternate".

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

Spraylock

Alternate 1

Section I: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for All Other Floor
Products and Floor Prep Supplies. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be submitted or proposal will not be considered.

 Total: 25%
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Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

UZIN

1
0 Section II: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Installation Services - Carpet Installation - per

square yard price for installation of carpet (Indoor and Outdoor). Price to include all necessary supplies, labor,
and related items to complete installation.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Yard Price: $4.50 Total: $4.50

Item Notes:
All companies responding must be approved by the manufacturer to install the brand of
carpet proposed and must provide written documentation from the manufacturer.

 

DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

ALL CARPETS BY SQ YARD

1
1 Section II: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Installation Services - Tile Installation - per

square foot price for installation of tile products. Price to include all necessary supplies, labor, and related items
to complete installation.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot Price: $2.50 Total: $2.50

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

SOFT TILE SQUARE FOOT

1
2 Section II: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Installation Services - Cove Base and Stair Tread

Installation - per linear foot price for installation of cove base and stair tread products. Price to include all
necessary supplies, labor, and related items to complete installation.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Linear Foot Price: $7.50 Total: $7.50

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.
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Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

RUBBLER LINEAL FOOT

1
3 Section II: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Installation Services - Terrazzo Flooring

Installation - per square foot price for installation of terrazzo products. Price to include all necessary supplies,
labor, and related items to complete installation.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot No Bid

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

No response

1
4 Section II: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Installation Services - Performance Stage

(Dance, Performing Arts and Entertainment) Installation - per square foot price for installation of stage
products. Price to include all necessary supplies, labor, and related items to complete installation.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot No Bid

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

No response

1
5 Section II: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Installation Services - Concrete Polishing,

Grinding and Sealing Flooring Installation - per square foot price for installation of concrete and sealing
products. Price to include all necessary supplies, labor, and related items to complete installation.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot No Bid

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

No response
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1
6 Section II: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Installation Services - Acid Staining/Dyeing

Flooring Installation - per square foot price for installation of acid/dye products. Price to include all necessary
supplies, labor, and related items to complete installation.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot No Bid

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

No response

1
7 Section II: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Installation Services - Joint Filler and Sealant

Flooring Installation - per square foot price for installation of joint filler and sealant products. Price to include all
necessary supplies, labor, and related items to complete installation.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot No Bid

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

No response

1
8 Section II: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Installation Services - Installation for All Other

Flooring and Floor Prep Products - per square foot price for installation of all other flooring and floor prep
products. Price to include all necessary supplies, labor, and related items to complete installation.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot Price: $65.00 Total: $65.00

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

PER 10-20LB BAG OF PREP
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1
9

Section III: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Removal Services - Removal of Existing Carpet
- per square yard price for removal of existing carpet products. Price to include all necessary supplies, labor, and
related items to complete removal.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Yard Price: $2.50 Total: $2.50

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

SQUARE YARD REMOVAL

2
0

Section III: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Removal Services - Removal of Existing
Coating, Glue, and Mastic Removal - per square yard price for removal of existing coating, glue, and mastic
products. Price to include all necessary supplies, labor, and related items to complete removal.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Yard Price: $9.00 Total: $9.00

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

ADHESIVE REMOVAL $1 SF

2
1

Section III: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Removal Services - Removal of Existing Tile -
per square foot price for removal of existing tile products. Price to include all necessary supplies, labor, and
related items to complete removal

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot Price: $4.00 Total: $4.00

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

TILE AT SF
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2
2

Section III: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Removal Services - Removal of Existing Cove
Base and Stair Tread - per linear foot price for removal of existing cove base and stair tread products. Price to
include all necessary supplies, labor, and related items to complete removal.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Linear Foot Price: $0.50 Total: $0.50

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

PER LINEAL FOOT

2
3

Section III: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Removal Services - Removal of Existing
Terrazzo - per square foot price for removal of terrazzo products. Price to include all necessary supplies, labor,
and related items to complete removal.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot No Bid

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

No response

2
4

Section III: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Removal Services - Removal of Existing
Performance Stage (Dance, Performing Arts, and Entertainment) - per square foot price for removal of
stage products. Price to include all necessary supplies, labor, and related items to complete removal.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot Price: $7.50 Total: $7.50

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

SF PRICING
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2
5

Section III: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Removal Services - Removal of Existing
Concrete Polishing, Grinding and Sealing - State the per square foot price for removal of concrete and
sealing products. Price to include all necessary supplies, labor, and related items to complete removal.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot No Bid

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

No response

2
6

Section III: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Removal Services - Removal of Existing Acid
Staining/Dyeing - per square foot price for removal of acid/dyeing products. Price to include all necessary
supplies, labor, and related items to complete removal.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot No Bid

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

No response

2
7

Section III: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Removal Services - Removal of Existing Joint
Filler and Sealant - per linear foot price for removal of joint filler and sealant products. Price to include all
necessary supplies, labor, and related items to complete removal.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Linear Foot Price: $1.00 Total: $1.00

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

LINEAL FT REMOVAL
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2
8

Section III: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Removal Services - Removal of All Other
Existing Flooring Products - per square foot price for removal of all other existing flooring products. Price to
include all necessary supplies, labor, and related items to complete removal.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot Price: $6.00 Total: $6.00

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

SQ FT REMOVAL

2
9 Section III: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Removal Services - Removal and Disposal of

Trash - per square foot price for the removal and disposal of trash. Price to include all necessary supplies, labor,
and related items to complete removal and disposal of trash.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot Price: $0.75 Total: $0.75

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

SQ FT REMOVAL

3
0 Section III: Carpet, Tile and Related Flooring Products Removal Services - Furniture and Equipment

Moving - per square foot price for furniture and equipment moving. Price to include all necessary supplies, labor,
and related items to complete moving of furniture and equipment.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Square Foot Price: $0.50 Total: $0.50

Item Notes: DEFINE SERVICES – Proposers must clearly define the services that are proposed to be provided and
attach detailed information.

Item Attributes

1. Define Services and/or List of Products per Unit of Measure

STANDARD FURNITURE ONLY
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3
1 Section IV: Carpet and Tile Cleaning Services - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Carpet Cleaning Services.

Catalog/Pricelist MUST be submitted or proposal will not be considered.
(Line excluded from response total)

 No Bid

Item Notes: Vendors proposing various manufacturer product lines per line item must submit the information as
follows or proposal may not be considered:

Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each Manufacturer listed.

Additional/Alternate Manufacturer lines must submitted by selecting "Add Alternate".

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

No response

3
2 Section IV: Carpet and Tile Cleaning Services - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Tile and Grout Cleaning

Services. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be submitted or proposal will not be considered.
(Line excluded from response total)

 No Bid

Item Notes: Vendors proposing various manufacturer product lines per line item must submit the information as
follows or proposal may not be considered:

Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each Manufacturer listed.

Additional/Alternate Manufacturer lines must submitted by selecting "Add Alternate".

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

No response

3
3 Section IV: Carpet and Tile Cleaning Services - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Wood Floor Cleaning

Services. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be submitted or proposal will not be considered.
(Line excluded from response total)

 No Bid

Item Notes: Vendors proposing various manufacturer product lines per line item must submit the information as
follows or proposal may not be considered:

Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each Manufacturer listed.

Additional/Alternate Manufacturer lines must submitted by selecting "Add Alternate".
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Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist

No response

Response Total: $111.25
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 Technical Services 
 

 

Vector Concepts Certification  Letter.docx  Page 1 of 1 

 
Chicago, October 23rd, 2020 
 
 
To: Lesa Hamilton 
 
Vector Concepts, Inc. 
9010 N Royal Ln # 110 
Irving, TX 75063 
 
 
Ref.: Certified Gerflor’s Product Supplier and Installation Company 
 
Dear Lesa, 

 
This letter is a confirmation that Vector Concepts, Inc.is a Gerflor Certified Supplier and Installation 
Dealer. 
 
This confirms that your team has all the required skills to specify and recommend the right products 
and accomplish the installation per our Installation Instructions that will reach Gerflor’s highest 
standards for fulfilling the customer’s expectations. 
 
This approval is valid until February 2023. 
 
Should you have any questions, do not hesitate to contact me. 
 
 
Respectfully yours, 
 

 
Ron Baker 
Senior Technical Manager 
Gerflor USA | Connor Sport | Sport Court International 
405 905 9970 
Gerflorusa.com | Connorsports.com | Sportcourt.com  
 
C.c.: Huiet England, Gerflor USA, Inc. 
 Michel Rochard, Gerflor USA, Inc. 

 

 

 

 

 

http://www.gerflorusa.com/
http://www.connorsports.com/
http://www.sportcourt.com/


 

 
                            
 
 
November 17, 2020 
 
 
Texas Association of School Boards 
Cooperative Purchasing Department 
12007 Research Boulevard 
Austin, TX.  78759 
 
 
Subject: J&J Flooring Group Authorization of Dealer and Installation – Proposal # 642-21 
 
 
To Whom It May Concern: 
 
Engineered Floors, LLC, dba J+J Flooring, hereby names Vector Concepts as an authorized 
dealer for purpose of the Buy Board contract.  By signing this letter, Engineered Floors hereby 
authorizes Vector Concepts to offer products and installation services listed on the Buy Board 
contract to any agency able to utilize these services. 
 
Engineered Floors agrees that authorization to Vector Concepts set forth in this letter shall 
remain effective until the TASB receives written notification that Engineered Floors has 
withdrawn its authorization to Vector Concepts or until the Buy Board expires. Vector Concepts 
is authorized to receive purchase orders and payment for the Engineered Floors contract 
products.   
 
For any comments or questions, you may contact me at 800.241.4586 x88389 or 
kay.henderson@engineeredfloors.com. 
 
Vector Concepts 
9010 N. Royal Lane #110 
Irving, TX  75063 
p. 800.544.8314 x229 
p. 972.313.3129 
f. 972.790.7535 
Jody C. Skaggs 
jskaggs@vectorconcepts.com 
 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
 
Kay Henderson 
Manager, Strategic Account Services 

mailto:jskaggs@vectorconcepts.com


Milliken & Company 

920 Milliken Road 

Spartanburg, SC  29303 

202-480-6461 

www.milliken.com 

 

 

 

November 12, 2020  

 

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative 

Attn: Bid Administrator 

12007 Research Blvd 

Austin, Texas 78759 

 

Re: Vector Concepts 

 Authorization for: Approved Dealer for Material and Installation 

 

To Whom it May Concern; 

Milliken & Company hereby names Vector Concepts as an authorized dealer for the BuyBoard contract 

between BuyBoard and Vector Concepts. By signing this letter, Milliken & Company hereby authorizes 

Vector Concepts, 9010 N. Royal Lane #110, Irving TX 75063, to offer Milliken products and services listed 

on the BuyBoard contract pursuant to the Terms and Conditions of their BuyBoard contract. 

 
Please feel free to contact me should you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 

 

Tamlin Antoine 
Director of Global Government Sales 

 

Cc:  Vector Concepts 

 



 

  
 
 
 
Reference: 

   
 
To Whom It May Concern, 
 

  
   

   
   

 
  

   
  

  
 

If there are any further questions, please do not hesitate to contact us. 

 
Best regards, 

 
Brent Fike 
General Manager of Technical & Installation 
(256) 200-0433 
bfike@roppeholdingcompany.com 
 

            

           


        

          


Buy Board Reference

             
           

     

              
                      

              

              
                  

             
   

              
            

            
    

              
            

               
 

                           

November 18,2020

Roppe is proud to partner with Vector Concepts in selling and installing Roppe products. 
We recommend Vector Comcepts to sell, install, and maintain any product that Roppe 
manufactures. They may market our products in any market they choose, to pursue business.

We are proud to team with Vector Comcepts in bringing Roppe products to market

mailto:bfike@roppeholdingcompany.com




 

 

   

 

 

8/21/2020 
 
Jody C. Skaggs 
Vector Concepts 
9010 N. Royal Lane, Suite 110 
Irving, TX 75063 
 
 
 
 

 

 
Dear Jody C. Skaggs:  
 
I am pleased to inform you that Vector Concepts is now recognized as a certified:  

 
“Level 1: UZIN - Subfloor Preparation Installer” 
 
This status is based upon the amount of training that your company has received from us over the past 
five-years, the quality levels of your installations that we were allowed to be a part of and the 
successful completion of those projects with our products.  
 
We are looking forward to working with you on future projects and will continue to provide high quality 
materials and service for safe, reliable and cost efficient flooring solutions. 
 
 
 
 
Best regards, 
 
Uzin Utz NA 

 

 

 

Matthias Liebert 

President 
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