Section A: Beef

Ben E Keith

Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor Item # |Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Beef Patties - For Catering - 100% Fresh Angus Beef Pattie, 80/20 Wide, 100% Ground Beef 40/40z 75 $29.95 $2,246.25
Substitute: $0.00
Beef Patties - For Music Festival - Holten Ground 75/25, Round, Raw, Frozen, 50ct/3.20z 12551| 200 $26.50 $5,300.00
Substitute: $0.00
Beef Patties - For Concessions - 100% Fresh Angus Ground Beef, 80/20, 1/2" thick - 30 ct/ 5.33 0z 480 $29.95 $14,376.00
Substitute: $0.00
Hotdogs 6/1 - For Concessions - Farm Land - 6/1 All-Beef Hotdogs 1/10lbs 811577| 165 $29.50 $4,867.50
Substitute: $0.00
Hotdogs 8/1 - For Music Festival - Farm Land 8/1 All-Beef Hotdogs 1/10lbs 789417| 70 $29.50 $2,065.00
Substitute: $0.00
Long Hotdogs 6/1 - For Corn Dogs - Farm Land - 6/1 Long, All-Beef Hotdogs 1/10lbs 70247811017| 60 $24.75 $1,485.00
Substitute: $0.00
Brisket - Special Order Only for Catered Events - 120 Trim No Roll, Fresh 5/12# D7102AH| 4 $167.40 $669.60
Substitute: $0.00
Roast Beef - Farmland - Sliced, Extra Thin, .5 oz, 6/2Ib 70247-921440| 3 $56.90 $170.70
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTION A | $31,180.05
Section B: Poultry
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor Item # |Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Chicken Tenders - Tyson - Homestyle Tenderloins, Small, Uncooked, Blanched Fritters, 10# 10341-0928| 375 $24.90 $9,337.50
Substitute: $0.00
Chicken Tenders - Tyson - Fully Cooked Homestyle, 10# 004942-0928( 15 $48.77 $731.55
$0.00
Bonless Wings - Pierce Chicken - Bonless Wing Dings - 2/5# 111125 50 $34.88 $1,744.00
Substitute: $0.00
Grilled Chicken Breast - Option 1 - Tyson - Fully Cooked, All Natural, Grilled Breast Filet w/ Grill Marks, 10#,
40z 48301-928| 58 $44.90 $2,604.20
Substitute: $0.00
Breaded Chicken Breast - Tyson - Fully Cooked, All Natural, Crumb Coated Filets, 4 0z, 1/10# 48313-928| 70 $40.10 $2,807.00
Substitute: $0.00
Chicken Fryer Split - Pilgrams Pride - half chickens, 1/36 ct 19919| 12 $60.00|1.20# $720.00
Substitute: $0.00
Turkey Leg - Yoakum - Smoked - 20-28 oz, 1/30# 6 $48.50 $291.00
Substitute: $0.00
Turkey - Farmland - Sliced, Extra Lean, .50z 6/2lb 70247-921450 6 $41.86 $251.16
Substitute: $0.00

TOTAL SECTION B

$18,486.41




Section C: Pork

Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor ltem # [Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Bacon - Tyson, Precooked, 300 Ct extra thin 204211| 35 $55.88 $1,955.80
Substitute: $0.00
Bacon Pieces - Armour - Fully Cooked, 1/2", 2/5# 3090011382| 15 $50.52 $757.80
Substitute: $0.00
Pork - Farmland, Butt Boneless, IW Frozen 6/6.5# 119627 15 $62.01 $930.15
Substitute: $0.00
Ham - Farmland - Deli Ham, Extra Lean, .50z 6/2Ib 70247-921450( 5 $41.86 $209.30
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTION C | $3,853.05
Section D: Misc Meats
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor Item # |Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Corn Dogs - State Fair, All Beef, 12#, 48/4 oz 04481 70 $34.18 $2,392.60
Substitute: $0.00
Taco Meat - Texas Chili - Taco Beef Filling, 4/5# 25 $43.70 $1,092.50
Substitute: $0.00
Homestyle Chili -Windsor Foods - Original Chili Bowl, w/o beans, 6/5# tubs 48306| 15 $56.88 $853.20
Substitute: $0.00
Sausage Topping - Bellissim - Italian, 2/5# 43212 5 $29.08 $145.40
Substitute: $0.00
Sausage On a Stick - Carl's - 9", 27/6 oz 5 $31.57 $157.85
Substitute: $0.00
Pepperoni Topping - Antonio's - Zesty Regular Sliced, 2/12.5# 64584| 15 $73.90 $1,108.50
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTIOND | $5,750.05
Section E: Fries - Option 1 - McCain USA
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor ltem # [Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
McCain Redstone Canyon Seasoned Spiral Fries, 6/4# MCL03622( 250 $25.82 $6,455.00
Substitute: $0.00
McCain Flavorlasts Regular Fries, Skin On, 3/8" PXL, 6/5# MCF03787] 340 $26.98 $9,173.20
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTION E1 | $15,628.20
Section F: Dairy
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor Item # |Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Pizza Cheese - Lone Star - Shredded Moz Chese, 6/5# 30236 70 $60.79 $4,255.30
Substitute: $0.00
Cheddar Cheese - Sliced -Mild, .75, 8/1.5# 700230( 10 $32.68 $326.80




Substitute: $0.00
Swiss Cheese - Sliced .75, 8/1.5# 4 $48.18 $192.72
Substitute: $0.00
Pepper Jack Cheese - Sliced - .75, 8/1.5# 4 $36.49 $145.96
Substitute: $0.00
Ice Cream Cups - Oak Farms - Vanilla, 24/3 oz 1020025( 28 $15.39 $423.23
Substitute: $0.00
Whipped Cream Aresol Cans 12/15 oz 7027248123 35 $28.37 $992.95
Substitute: $0.00
Milk - 2% White, 4/1 Gal 18403| 15 $15.60 $234.00
Substitute: $0.00
Milk - Whole , 4/1 Gal 30 $16.30 $489.00
Substitute: $0.00
American Cheese-Yellow 160ct, 4/5lb 34947| 40 $39.89 $1,595.60
Substitute: $0.00
Shredded Cheddar Cheese, Feather 4/51b 10985CS| 50 $21.57 $1,078.50
Substitute: $0.00
Daisy Sour Cream 100/1 0z IDP100( 10 $9.79 $97.90
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTIONF | $9,831.96
Section G: Bread
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor Iltem # [Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Hotdog Buns - Regular Conneys 6/12ct 320( 200 $14.29 $2,858.00
Substitute: $0.00
Hamburger Buns - 4" 5/12ct 005888( 215 $11.60 $2,494.00
Substitute: $0.00
Brioche Burger Buns - 4" - European Bakers - 8/12ct 10588020 300 $20.99 $6,297.00
Substitute: $0.00
Hamburger Buns -Rotella's - Frozen - 4.5", Sliced 6/8 ct 00407 25 $19.87 $496.75
Substitute: $0.00
Hamburger Buns - Rotella's - Onion Kaiser - 4.25" Sliced, 6/8 ct 00409( 10 $23.99 $239.90
Substitute: $0.00
Wholegrain Burger Bun - 4" - European Bakers - 10/12ct 10520310| 17 $38.60 $643.46
Substitute: $0.00
Hamburger Buns - Smart Flour - Gluten Free - 4", 1/24 ct 633569| 5 $23.49 $117.45
Substitute: $0.00
Sliced Sandwich Bread- Large 8/24 oz 00001| 20 $13.10 $262.00
Substitute: $0.00
Ciabatta Sandwich BunEuropean Baker - Sliced 4" x 6", 8/18 ct 10528610( 4 $39.88 $159.52
Substitute: $0.00
Sliced Bread - European Baker - Deli Style, Hearty Wheat w/ Bran, 18 slices/24 oz, 1/8 ct 40099910 4 $30.59 $122.36

Substitute:

$0.00




Printed Pullman - European Bakers - Extra Soft White - 24 slices/20 oz, 1/12 ct 105101140 4 $28.39 $113.56
Substitute: $0.00
Roll Hoagie - European Bakers - Hearth White, Hinge Sliced, 2.5 0z, 12/6 ct 40083100 4 $33.38 $133.52
Substitute: $0.00
Sliced Sourdough - European Bakers - Thick Slice, 32 0z, 1/8 ct 10508210 12 $33.38 $400.56
Substitute: $0.00
Tortillas - Rudy's - Tortilla Corn 4.5" White, 6/96# 2102CLR| 5 $17.85 $89.25
Substitute: $0.00
Taco Shell - Mission -5" yellow, 8/25# 7381 5 $10.98 $54.90
Substitute: $0.00
Tortillas - Mission - Flour, Pressed 6" 24/12 ct 10400| 5 $23.25 $116.25
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTION G | $14,598.48
Section H: Chips
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor Item # |Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Ruffle Chips Bulk 8/160z 47736( 20 $18.71 $374.20
Substitute: $0.00
Tortilla Chips - Tostitos - Round Crispy - 8/16 0z 20 $14.79 $295.80
Substitute: $0.00
Lays Chips Baked BBQ LSS 44395 5 $27.79 $138.95
Substitute: $0.00
Lays Regular Potato Chips Baked 64/1.12 0z 44396 5 $27.79 $138.95
Substitute: $0.00
Lays Regular Potato Chips 64/1.5 0z 44359| 10 $27.79 $277.90
Substitute: $0.00
Doritos Nacho Cheese Chips 64/1.75 ox 44375| 10 $27.79 $277.90
Substitute: $0.00
Cheetos Chips Crunchy 64/2 oz 44366| 8 $27.49 $219.92
Substitute: $0.00
Lays BBQ Masterpiece Chips 64/1.5 0z 44358 5 $27.49 $137.45
Substitute: $0.00
Cheetos Crunchy SS 104/1 oz 32419( 15 $31.97 $479.55
Substitute: $0.00
Ruffles Regular Chips SS 104/1 oz 11061] 135 $31.97 $4,315.95
Substitute: $0.00
Doritos Nacho Cheese Chips SS 104/1 0z 11142 15 $31.97 $479.55
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTION H $7,136.12

Section I: Pizza

Description

MFG #|Qty |Vendor Item # |Cost/Case |Qty/Case |T0tal Cost




Pizza Crust - Gina - 7" Crust, Wood Oven Style Pizza Crust, 1/48 ct 450541 155 No Bid $0.00
Substitute: $0.00
Pizza Crust - Gina - 16" Crust. Wood Oven Style Pizza Crust, 1/20 ct 450536 18 No Bid $0.00
Substitute: $0.00
Pizza Sauce - Bellissim - X-Heavy w/ Basil - 6/10 # 190202 25 $25.20 $630.00
Substitute: $0.00
Pizza Box - Plain 16"x16"x1 7/8", Corrugated 1/50ct 15 $19.70 $295.50
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTION | $925.50
Did not bid section.
Section J: Condiments
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor Item # |Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Redgold Ketchup Packets, 1000ct 100 $15.69 $1,569.00
Substitute: $0.00
PPI Mustard Packets 5.5gm, 500 ct 56 $11.69 $654.64
Substitute: $0.00
PPl Mayonnaise Packets 9gm, 200 ct 81 $11.77 $953.37
Substitute: $0.00
PPI Relish Packets 9gm, 500ct 35 $11.98 $419.30
Substitute: $0.00
Alamo Street Picante Sauce, 200/0.5 0z 00002| 5 $9.98 $49.90
Substitute: $0.00
Ranch Sauce, Bulk 4/1 gal 10 $36.19 $361.90
Substitute: $0.00
Cattleman's BBQ Sauce-Original 4/1Gal 05316] 5 $41.57 $207.85
Substitute: $0.00
Franks Red Hot Buffalo Sauce 4/1 Gal 4150005560 5 $44.87 $224.35
Substitute: $0.00
Honey Mustard - Hidden Valley - 4/1gal 3 $45.17 $135.51
Substitute: $0.00
Flavor Concentrate - Minor's - Chipotle, 6/14.4 oz 11003109 4 $42.97 $171.88
Substitute: $0.00
Flavor Concentrate - Minor's - Sun Dried Tomato Pesto, 6/13.6 oz 11003426 4 $50.47 $201.88
Substitute: $0.00
Flavor Concentrate - Minor's - Fire Roasted Poblano, 6/13.6 oz 12225862 4 $38.27 $153.08
Substitute: $0.00
Flavor Concentrate - Minor's - Fire Roasted Jalapeno, 6/13.6 0z 12225863 4 $39.97 $159.88
Substitute: $0.00
Flavor Concentrate - Minor's - Cilantro Lime, 6/13.6 oz 11003436 4 $50.98 $203.92
Substitute: $0.00
Wing Sauce - Sweet Baby Ray's - Honey Hot Wing Sauce - GF - 4/.5 Gal 2993HA[ 8 $30.98 $247.84
Substitute: Sweet Baby Ray Honey BBQ $0.00
Wing Sauce - Minor's/Nestle - Buffalo Wing Sauce - 4/.5 Gal 1242785 2 No Bid $0.00




Substitute: $0.00
Wing Sauce - Minor's/Nestle - Orange Wing Sauce - 4/.5 Gal 12342784 2 No Bid $0.00
Substitute: $0.00
Wing Sauce - Minor's/Nestle - BBQ Wing Sauce - 4/.5 Gal 12342786 2 No Bid $0.00
Substitute: $0.00
Wing Sauce - Minor's/Nestle - Korean Wing Sauce - 4/.5 Gal 12314487 2 No Bid $0.00
Substitute: $0.00
Wing Sauce - Sweet Baby Ray's - Garlic Parmesan - 4/.5 Gal 2671HA[ 2 $29.87 $59.74
Substitute: $0.00
Butter Alternate - Grill On - ZTF, 3/1 Gal 10 $32.48 $324.80
Substitute: $0.00
Season Salt - Lawry's, 1/5# 10 $14.87 $148.70
Substitute: $0.00
Salt Packets 3/1000ct 3 $7.38 $22.14
Substitute: $0.00
Pepper Packets 3/1000ct 3 $18.20 $54.60
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTION J | $6,324.28
Section K: Fryer Shortening
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor Iltem # [Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Mel-Fry Free Soy 1/35Ib 40013| 120 $22.60 $2,712.00
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTIONK | $2,712.00
Section L: Misc Foods
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor Item # |Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Pre-Cut Tortilla Chips, Raw, White, 4 cut 6/16 doz 5208( 40 $22.29 $891.60
Substitute: $0.00
Cheese Curds - Freds - Battered White Cheddar - 6/2# 0206420 20 $61.67 $1,233.40
Substitute: $0.00
Corn Dog Mix - Gilster - 6/5# 71923-65060| 10 $22.68|???? $226.80
Substitute: $0.00
Hamburger Pickles 1/5 Gal 14104 14 $17.38 $243.32
Substitute: $0.00
Jalapenos-Sliced 6/10lb 00115| 10 $21.98 $219.80
Substitute: $0.00
Swanson Beef Broth, 12/49.50z 02422 5 $26.99 $134.95
Substitute: $0.00
Cheese Sauce - Gehl's - Queso Blanco - 6/60 oz G20001] 15 $39.49 $592.35
Substitute: $0.00
Cheese Sauce - Gehl's - Smoky Bacon Cheddar - 6/60 0z G20002| 15 No Bid $0.00




Substitute: $0.00
Cheese Sauce - Gehl's - Taco - 6/60 oz G20003| 15 No Bid $0.00
Substitute: $0.00
*Refried Beans - Vegetarian 6/10# 35215179| 5 $36.87 $184.35
Substitute: $0.00
*Baked Beans - Allens - 6/10lb 42217| 15 $34.79 $521.85
Substitute: $0.00
*Reser's Pasta Salad-Bow Tie Floretine 2/4.5# 2.5 $41.78 $104.45
Substitute: $0.00
*Ron's Southern Potato Salad with Mustard 2/12# 14 $35.88 $502.32
Substitute: $0.00
*Stouffer Macaroni & Cheese 4/76 oz 30340700 5 $30.97 $154.85
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTION L | $5,010.04
*Special order based on catered meal bookings
Section M: Food Service Chemicals
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor Item # |Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Degreaser - 4/1 gal 25 $28.87 $721.75
Substitute: $0.00
Pink Dish Soap 4/1 Gal 20 $30.85 $617.00
Substitute: $0.00
Bleach 6/1 Gal 10 $12.18 $121.80
Substitute: $0.00
Scouring Pads, 6/10ct S960( 10 $28.79 $287.90
Substitute: $0.00
Scrubbing Sponge, 8/5ct 20946| 5 $36.58 $182.90
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTIONM | $1,931.35
Section N: Nacho Sauces
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor Item # |Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Oretega Nacho Cheese Sauce Pouch, 4/107 oz 706068 95 $39.90 $3,790.50
Substitute: $0.00
Oretega Nacho Chili Sauce Pouch, 4/107 oz 711217 22 $37.60 $827.20
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTIONN | $4,617.70
Section O: Slush Mix
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor Iltem # [Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Sluch Mix - Sunny Sky - Jolly Rancher - Blue Raspberry, 6/.5 gal 10 No Bid $0.00




Substitute: $0.00
Slush Mix - Sunny Sky - Jolly Rancher - Green Apple, 6/.5 gal 10 No Bid $0.00
Substitute: $0.00
Slush Mix - Sunny Sky - Jolly Rancher - Cherry, 6/.5 gal 10 No Bid $0.00
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTION O $0.00

Section P: Core Snack Foods
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor ltem # [Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
J&J Funnel Cakes - Pre Cooked, 8" King Size, 1/48 ct 4503|100 $63.80 $6,380.00
Substitute: $0.00
Bavarian Pretzel, Texas Twist, 40/7 oz 7041| 55 $44.70 $2,458.50
Substitute: Not Allowed $0.00
Twinkie Deep Fried - Hostess - 2/4# 30 $34.77 $1,043.10
Substitute: $0.00
Califfornia Churro Bites - J&J Snacks - 2" - 1/500 ct 004185| 15 $38.55 $578.25
Substitute: $0.00
Chocolate Chip Cookies-Bulk 1/324ct 01322| 60 $20.29 $1,217.40
Substitute: $0.00
Sugar Cookies-Bulk 1/324ct 01319| 20 $17.88 $357.60
Substitute: $0.00
Vanilla Icing - Rich's - Heat 'N Ice - 1/12# 09976| 5 $23.39 $116.95
Substitute: $0.00
Strawberry Topping - Lyons - 6/5# 2373| 30 $48.57 $1,457.10
Substitute: $0.00
Powered Sugar 24/1# 401367| 15 $24.59 $368.85
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTION P | $13,977.75
-$1,457.10
$12,520.65

Section Q: Misc Snack Foods
Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor Item # |Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Chill - Smooth Fruit Ice - J&J Snacks - Verry Strawberry - 1/12 ct - 16 oz cups 611203| 10 $18.59 $185.90
Substitute: $0.00
Chill - Smooth Fruit Ice - J&J Snacks - Wild Watermelon Wipeout - 1/12 ct - 16 0z cups 611213]| 10 $18.59 $185.90
Substitute: $0.00
Chill - Smooth Fruit Ice - J&J Snacks - Double Lemon - 1/12 ct - 16 0z cups 611221| 10 $18.59 $185.90
Substitute: $0.00
Apple Cobbler - Mrs. Smith - 4/5# 4001269 4 $29.87 $119.48
Substitute: $0.00
Popcorn - Yellow Kernel 1/50# 5 $29.49 $147.45
Substitute: $0.00
TOTAL SECTION Q $824.63




Section R: Dry/Paper Goods

Description MFG #|Qty |Vendor ltem # [Cost/Case |Qty/Case |Total Cost
Hotdog Bag - Foil hotdog size 1/1000ct 300456| 6 $33.57 $201.42
Substitute: $0.00
Foil/Paper Honeycomb Insulated Wrap "Hamburger/Cheeseburger/Special” - 10.5" x 14", 4/500 ct 300854| 3.2 $276.77 $885.66
Substitute: $0.00
Paper Liner - Dry Wax Paper Wrap & Liner - Big Red Checkers, 12" x 12", 2/1M ct 300317| 14 $37.18 $520.52
Substitute: $0.00
Paper Liner - Dry Wax Paper Wrap & Liner - Big Blue Checkers, 12" x 12", 2/1M ct 300309| 14 $37.18 $520.52
Substitute: $0.00
Ice Bags - Clear Plastic Ice Bags, 1/250 ct, 20# 5 $71.09 $355.45
Substitute: $0.00
Film - 12" PVC plastic roll 2000 ft 9062 25 $15.85 $396.25
Substitute: $0.00
Foil - Reynolds, foil roll, heavy weight, 1000 ft, 24" 627 8 $75.58 $604.64
Substitute: $0.00
French Fry Bags - 6" x 4.5" 1/2000 ct FF3RP| 30 $21.65 $649.50
Substitute: $0.00
Food Boat - #25, 4/250 ct 08706 20 $12.10 $242.00
Substitute: $0.00
Food Boat - #200 4/250 ct 8702 50 $25.87 $1,293.50
Substitute: $0.00
Food Boat - #300 2/250 ct 8703 15 $19.38 $290.70
Substitute: $0.00
Meal Kits - Fork/Knife/Salt/Pepper/Napkin, Wrapped 1/250 ct 2477| 25 $17.88 $447.00
Substitute: $0.00
Spoons - Plastic, Medium Weight, Wrapped 1/1000 ct 02485| 60 $21.48 $1,288.80
Substitute: $0.00
Forks - Plastic, Medium Weight, Wrapped 1/1000 ct 2482 10 $21.48 $214.80
Substitute: $0.00
Plastic Plate - Black 9" 500 ct 50 $50.67 $2,533.50
Substitute: $0.00
Coated Paper Plate - 8.6" "COATED" White, 10/50 ct 330176S| 33 $51.69 $1,679.93
Substitute: $0.00
Plastic Cup - Clear 16 0z 20/50 ct 16K| 15 $55.59 $833.85
Substitute: $0.00
Plastic Cup - Fabrikal - Insert Combo Pack - 12 oz, 1/500 ct 118854 3 $67.39 $202.17
Substitute: $0.00
Pan Liner - Quillon 17" x 25" 1/1000 ct 3 $50.19 $150.57
Substitute: $0.00
Souffles Cup - Translucent Plastic, 2 0z 20/125 ct 200PC| 10 $31.57 $315.70
Substitute: $0.00




Souffles Lid - Translucent Plastic 2 0z 10/250ct 10 $27.08 $270.80
Substitute: $0.00
Souffles Cup - Translucent Plastic, 3.25 0z 20/125 ct 325PC| 10 $26.77 $267.70
Substitute: $0.00
Souffles Lid - Translucent Plastic 3.25 o0z 10 $24.19 $241.90
Substitute: $0.00
Filter Paper - 16.5" x 25.5" 1/100 ct 15165 2 $63.37 $126.74
Substitute: $0.00
Embossed Gloves - Small 10/100 ct 63211 10 $24.97 $249.70
Substitute: $0.00
Embossed Gloves-Medium 10/100 ct 63212 63 $24.97 $1,573.11
Substitute: $0.00
Embossed Gloves - Large 10/100 ct 63213 38 $24.97 $948.86
Substitute: $0.00
Straws - Jumbo, Wrapped 24/500 ct 9731| 30 $48.77 $1,463.10
Substitute: $0.00
Napkins - TorkUniversal Xpressnap Environental Print Dispenser Napkin, Interfold 13" x 8.5" 12/500 ct DX906E| 30 $37.88 $1,136.40
Substitute: $0.00
Hotdog Trays - Paper, 8" White 1/500 ct HD4085| 5 $30.69 $153.45
Substitute: $0.00

TOTAL SECTION R

$20,058.24
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