DESCRIPTION
SECTION A
1 24” DR18 C-900 PVC Water Pipe
2 16” DR18 C-900 PVC Water Pipe
3 12" DR18 C-900 PVC Water Pipe
4 10" DR18 C-900 PVC Water Pipe
5 8" DR18 C-900 PVC Water Pipe
6 6” DR18 C-900 PVC Water Pipe
7 4” DR18 C-900 PVC Water Pipe
8 12" DR18 C-900 PVC Restraint Joint Water Pipe
9 10" DR18 C-900 PVC Restraint Joint Water Pipe
10 8" DR18 C-900 PVC Restraint Joint Water Pipe
11 6” DR18 C-900 PVC Restraint Joint Water Pipe
12 4" X 14' SDR 35 Sewer Pipe
13 6" X 14' SDR 35 Sewer Pipe
14 8" X 14' SDR 35 Sewer Pipe
15 10" X 14' SDR 35 Sewer Pipe
16 21" X 14' SDR 35 Sewer Pipe
17 24" X 14' SDR 35 Sewer Pipe
18 6" X 14' DR 21 Sewer Pipe Restraint Joint
19 8" X 14' DR 21 Sewer Pipe Restraint Joint
20 10" X 14' DR 26 Sewer Pipe Restraint Joint
Section "A" TOTAL

SECTION B

1 Valve Box w/lid 18”-24” (Bass & Hayes 1842s)
2 Valve Box & Lid (Bass & Hayes 340-1)
3 2"Valve Box Riser (Bass & Hayes)
4 24" Gate Valve with applicable accessories
5 16" Gate Valve with applicable accessories
6 12" Gate Valve with applicable accessories
7 10" Gate Valve with applicable accessories
8 8" Gate Valve with applicable accessories
9 6" Gate Valve with applicable accessories

10 Fire Hydrant 6.0 Bury with accessories

11 Fire Hydrant 5.5 Bury with accessories

12 Fire Hydrant 5.0 Bury with accessories

13 Fire Hydrant 4.5 Bury with accessories

14 Fire Hydrant 4.0 Bury with accessories

EST.QTY UOM
40 LF
40 LF
40 LF
40 LF

100 LF
400 LF
80 LF
200 LF
200 LF
200 LF
10000 LF
560 LF
200 LF
70 LF
70 LF
28 LF
28 LF
1000 LF
200 LF
200 LF

EST.QTY UOM
16 EA
16 EA

100 EA
1EA
1EA
2 EA
2 EA

10 EA
40 EA
5 EA
5 EA
5 EA
5 EA
5 EA

North Richland Hills

NRKH

24-025
WATER & WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIAL

2:00PM (CST) TUESDAY, JUNE 25,2024

Atlas Utility Supply Co
UNIT BID PRICE

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

UNIT BID PRICE

$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$

225.05
137.02
61.22
23,995.00
8,240.00
2,585.00
2,045.00
1,335.00
850.00
2,950.00
2,880.00
2,820.00
2,755.00
2,695.00

AMOUNT BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

AMOUNT BID

3,600.80
2,192.32
6,122.00
23,995.00
8,240.00
5,170.00
4,090.00
13,350.00
34,000.00
14,750.00
14,400.00
14,100.00
13,775.00
13,475.00

Consolidated Pipe and Supply

UNIT BID PRICE
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID

UNIT BID PRICE
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID

AMOUNT BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID

AMOUNT BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID

HD Supply Waterworks North Texas Winwater
UNIT BID PRICE AMOUNT BID UNIT BID PRICE AMOUNT BID

$ 182.76 $ 7,310.40 $ 139.89 $ 5,595.60
$ 81.89 $ 3,275.60 $ 63.16 $ 2,526.40
$ 53.72 $ 2,148.80 $ 4538 $ 1,815.20
$ 38.15 $ 1,526.00 $ 3224 $ 1,289.60
$ 2541 $ 2,541.00 $ 2149 $ 2,149.00
$ 14.83 $ 5,932.00 $ 1253 $ 5,012.00
$ 727 $ 581.60 $ 6.14 $ 491.20
$ 74.40 $ 14,880.00 $ 61.32 $ 12,264.00
$ 53.01 $ 10,602.00 $ 44.00 $ 8,800.00
$ 3420 $ 6,840.00 $ 28.50 $ 5,700.00
$ 20.17 $ 201,700.00 $ 16.82 $  168,200.00
$ 288 $ 1,612.80 $ 243 $ 1,360.80
$ 6.63 $ 1,326.00 $ 560 $ 1,120.00
$ 12.04 $ 842.80 $ 10.18 $ 712.60
$ 1872 $ 1,310.40 $ 15.83 $ 1,108.10
$ 7020 $ 1,965.60 $ 53.74 $ 1,504.72
$ 89.21 $ 2,497.88 $ 6785 $ 1,899.80
$ 15.85 $ 15,850.00 $ 14.37 $ 14,370.00
$ 26.57 $ 5,314.00 $ 2263 $ 4,526.00
$ 35.33 $ 7,066.00 $ 30.85 $ 6,170.00

$ 295,122.88 $  246,615.02

UNIT BID PRICE AMOUNT BID UNIT BID PRICE AMOUNT BID

$ 22561 $ 3,609.76 $ 23047 $ 3,687.52
$ 137.36 $ 2,197.76 $ 14032 $ 2,245.12
$ 61.37 §$ 6,137.00 $ 62.69 $ 6,269.00
$ 25,223.22 $ 25,223.22 $ 23,849.42 $ 23,849.42
$ 9,042.01 $ 9,042.01 $ 8,566.54 $ 8,566.54
$ 2,900.11 $ 5,800.22 $ 2,879.32 $ 5,758.64
$ 2,309.90 $ 4,619.80 $ 2,342.43 $ 4,684.86
$ 1,486.57 $ 14,865.70 $ 1,481.44 $ 14,814.40
$ 952.47 $ 38,098.80 $ 951.22 $ 38,048.80
$ 3,314.04 $ 16,570.20 $ 2,949.99 $ 14,749.95
$ 3,136.96 $ 15,684.80 $ 2,918.78 $ 14,593.90
$ 3,069.57 §$ 15,347.85 $ 2,856.92 $ 14,284.60
$ 3,051.31 $ 15,256.55 $ 2,795.07 $ 13,975.35
$ 2,934.78 $ 14,673.90 $ 2,73322 $ 13,666.10



15 6” Romac RG-PVC-D Romagrip

16 8” Romac RG-PVC-D Romagrip

17 10” Romac RG-PVC-D

18 12” Romac RG-PVC-D Romagrip

19 16” Romac RG-PVC-D Romagrip

20 24” Romac RG-PVC-D Romagrip

21 8"x 6" Tapping Sleeve (Ford #FTSC-912X6)

22 6" x 6" Tapping Sleeve (Ford #FTSC-716X6)

23 6"x 1" Bronze Service Saddle (Romac #101B-750 X 1” CC)
24 8"x 1" Bronze Service Saddle (Romac #101B-962 X 1” CC)
25 1" Corporation CC x Compression (Ford#F1000-4G- NL)

26 3/4" Curb Stop FIP x FIP (Ford # B11-333-WR- NL)

27 3/4" IP x Meter Swivel Nut Curb Stop (Ford # B13-332W- NL)
28 2" Curb Stop FIP x FIP (Ford # B11-777W-NL)

29 U-Branch 1" x 3/4" (Ford # U88-43-7.5-NL)

30 1" Compression x FIP Curbstop (Ford # B41-444-WR-NL)

31 3/4"x5/8" x 7" Meter Riser (Resetter) (Ford # V42-7W-NL)

32 3/4 Coupling, Compression (Ford # C44-33G-NL)

33 3/4 Coupling, MIP X Compression (Ford # C84-33G-NL)

34 3/4 Coupling, FIP X Compression (Ford # C14-33G-NL)

35 1"90° Compression X Compression (Ford L44-44G-NL)

36 1" Coupling, Compression (Ford # C44-44G-NL)

37 1" Coupling, MIP X Compression (Ford # C84-44G-NL)

38 1" Coupling, FIP X Compression (Ford # C14-44G-NL)

39 2" Coupling, FIP X Compression (Ford # C14-77G-NL)

40 2" Coupling, Compression (Ford # C44-77G-NL)

41 2" Corporation, CC X Compression Ford #FB1000-7G-NL)

42 2" Coupling, MIP X Compression (Ford # C84-77G-NL)

43 2" Angle stop, Flange X Compression (Ford # FV43-777WG-NL)
44 3/4" X 2.5” Meter Coupling (Ford # C38-23-2-5-NL)

45 1"FIP XFIP Curb Stop ( Ford # B11-444 WR-NL)

46 ¥%” Angle Stop Meter Swivel Nut X FIP (Ford #BA13-332W-NL)
47 Double Meter Box with AMR Holes NDS # D15AMR2-DU LOSB
48 Double Meter Box Lid Only DFW Alliance 1200.SD.LID

49 Single Meter Box with AMR Hole DFW Alliance 1300.12.1T.Small
50 DFW 1500.1.LID DFW Plastics

51 Plastic Meter Box with AMR w/HOLE, DFW PLASTICS DFW1730F-18-IDF Small
52 21/2" Castlron Riser Ring for Manhole (Bass & Hays)

53 4" CastlIron Riser Ring for Manhole (Bass & Hays)

54 6" Castlron Riser Ring for Manhole (Bass & Hays)

80 EA
35 EA
4 EA
4 EA
4 EA
4 EA
1EA
1EA
90 EA
25 EA
150 EA
100 EA
100 EA
15 EA
40 EA
100 EA
150 EA
40 EA
50 EA
30 EA
40 EA
300 EA
30 EA
50 EA
10 EA
15 EA
5 EA
10 EA
15 EA
160 EA
20 EA
100 EA
500 EA
100 EA
75 EA
150 EA
20 EA
15 EA
5 EA
2 EA

North Richland Hills

NRKH

24-025

WATER & WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIAL
2:00PM (CST) TUESDAY, JUNE 25,2024

R R R R R C R R C R - R R SR R - R R SR R TR LR

52.00
76.00
145.00
160.00
365.00
615.00
560.00
570.00
140.00
146.00
53.37
58.92
66.21
260.77
43.21
99.75
101.27
22.54
16.17
17.08
32.70
22.54
19.16
23.09
79.94
101.81
254.51
76.48
261.29
10.51
89.71
74.51
43.55
8.50
26.50
13.95
305.00
284.74
354.32
531.49

R i - - - A - R

4,160.00
2,660.00
580.00
640.00
1,460.00
2,460.00
560.00
570.00
12,600.00
3,650.00
8,005.50
5,892.00
6,621.00
3,911.55
1,728.40
9,975.00
15,190.50
901.60
808.50
510.90
1,308.00
6,762.00
574.80
1,154.50
799.40
1,627.15
1,272.55
764.80
3,919.35
1,681.60
1,794.20
7,451.00
21,775.00
850.00
1,987.50
2,092.50
6,100.00
4,271.10
1,771.60
1,062.98

INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID

INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID
INCOMPLETE BID

R i i e - - - R

44.86
66.03
126.14
132.06
296.28
524.84
513.20
521.44
65.34
83.28
61.26
67.62
75.99
299.31
49.60
114.49
116.24
22.61
18.56
19.54
37.58
25.87
21.99
26.51
91.75
116.86
292.12
87.78
299.91
12.06
102.96
85.52
43.20
8.39
23.62
13.84
299.27
285.45
355.21
532.82

RO R R R C R R R - R R R R G- - R R R LR

3,588.80
2,311.05
504.56
528.24
1,185.12
2,099.36
513.20
521.44
5,880.60
2,082.00
9,189.00
6,762.00
7,599.00
4,489.65
1,984.00
11,449.00
17,436.00
904.40
928.00
586.20
1,501.20
7,761.00
659.70
1,325.50
917.50
1,752.90
1,460.60
877.80
4,498.65
1,929.60
2,059.20
8,552.00
21,600.00
839.00
1,771.50
2,076.00
5,985.40
4,281.75
1,776.05
1,065.64

$h B B P L P L P B P

P H P P B P L P

47.37
69.70
133.15
139.40
312.75
554.00
443.61
437.32
129.42
135.85
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
41.37
9.53
23.63
12.46
295.98
288.49
358.99
538.49

3,789.60
2,439.50
532.60
557.60
1,251.00
2,216.00
443.61
437.32
11,647.80
3,396.25
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
20,685.00
953.00
1,772.25
1,869.00
5,919.60
4,327.35
1,794.95
1,076.98



North Richland Hills

NRKH

24-025
WATER & WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIAL
2:00PM (CST) TUESDAY, JUNE 25,2024

55 Manhole Ring & Lid (Bass & Hays 300-24) 20 EA $ 602.52 $ 12,050.40 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 604.03 $ 12,080.60 $ 620.36 $ 12,407.20
56 Manhole Lid Only (Bass & Hays 300-24) 40 EA $ 286.41 $ 11,456.40 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 287.13 $ 11,485.20 $ 294.89 $ 11,795.60
57 Manhole Ring & Lid Bolt Down 4 Bolt (Bass & Hayes 300-24) 4 EA $ 708.76 $ 2,835.04 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 71054 $ 2,842.16 $ 718.10 $ 2,872.40
58 6"x 7 1/2" Clamp Stainless Single Band (Ford # F1-724-7.5) 30 EA $ 11250 $ 3,375.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 68.79 $ 2,063.70 $ 80.72 $ 2,421.60
59 6"x 7 1/2" Clamp Stainless Double Band(Ford # F2-764-7.5) 20 EA $ 153.75 $ 3,075.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 13091 $ 2,618.20 $ 11132 $ 2,226.40
60 6"x 15" Clamp Stainless Single Band (Ford # F1-724-15) 15 EA $ 214.25 $ 3,213.75 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 12335 $ 1,850.25 $ 145.18 $ 2,177.70
61 6"x 15" Clamp Stainless Double Band (Ford # F2-764-15) 10 EA $ 307.00 $ 3,070.00 INCOMPLETEBID INCOMPLETE BID $ 228.16 $ 2,281.60 $ 209.36 $ 2,093.60
62 8" X7 1/2" Clamp Stainless Single Band (Ford # F1-939-7.5) 20 EA $ 132.00 $ 2,640.00 INCOMPLETEBID INCOMPLETE BID $ 80.67 $ 1,613.40 $ 96.56 $ 1,931.20
63 8"x71/2" Clamp Stainless Double Band (Ford # F2-979-7.5) 10 EA $ 173.50 $ 1,735.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 137.45 $ 1,374.50 $ 121.84 $ 1,218.40
64 8"x 15" Clamp Stainless Single Band (Ford # F1-939-15) 10 EA $ 256.50 $ 2,565.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 14361 $ 1,436.10 $ 179.26  $ 1,792.60
65 8"x 15" Clamp Stainless Double Band (Ford # F2-979-15) 10 EA $ 349.50 $ 3,495.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 238.23 $ 2,382.30 $ 238.06 $ 2,380.60
66 10"x 15" Clamp Stainless Single Band (Ford # F1-1144-15) 5 EA $ 339.50 $ 1,697.50 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 17460 $ 873.00 $ 22263 $ 1,113.15
67 10"x 15" Clamp Stainless Double Band (Ford # F2-1184-15) 5 EA $ 441.00 $ 2,205.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 262.45 $ 1,312.25 $ 307.46 $ 1,537.30
68 12" x 15" Clamp Stainless Single Band (Ford # F1-1350-15) 5 EA $ 391.50 $ 1,957.50 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 19252 $ 962.60 $ 256.52 $ 1,282.60
69 12" x 15" Clamp Stainless Double Band (Ford # F2-1394-15) 5 EA $ 483.00 $ 2,415.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 266.94 $ 1,334.70 $ 335.00 $ 1,675.00
70 Manhole Lid- (Bass & Hays VRM30) 5 EA $ 330.72 $ 1,653.60 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 331.54 $ 1,657.70 $ 342.35 $ 1,711.75
71 Manhole Ring- (Bass & Hays VRM30) 5 EA $ 285.03 $ 1,425.15 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 28575 $ 1,428.75 $ 301.63 $ 1,508.15
72 Ductile Iron Fittings with accessories 5TON $ 7,000.00 $ 35,000.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 12,000.00 $ 60,000.00 NO BID NO BID
Section "B" TOTAL $  418,929.44 INCOMPLETE BID $  449,957.19 $  296,448.86
SECTION C EST.QTY UOM UNITBIDPRICE AMOUNT BID UNIT BID PRICE AMOUNT BID UNIT BID PRICE AMOUNT BID UNIT BID PRICE AMOUNT BID
1 6" "Hymax Coupling (Part # 2000-0768-260) 130 EA $ 330.00 $ 42,900.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 288.49 $ 37,503.70 $ 251.70 $ 32,721.00
2 8""Hymax Coupling (Part # 2000-0984-260) 50 EA $ 375.00 $ 18,750.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 325.72 $ 16,286.00 $ 285.08 $ 14,254.00
3 10" "Hymax Coupling (Part # 860-54-0272-16) 6 EA $ 485.00 $ 2,910.00 INCOMPLETEBID INCOMPLETE BID $ 419.01 $ 2,514.06 $ 350.00 $ 2,100.00
4 12" "Hymax Coupling (Part # 860-54-0334-16) 12 EA $ 705.00 $ 8,460.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 591.68 $ 7,100.16 $ 427.00 $ 5,124.00
5 16" "Hymax Coupling (Part # 860-56-0434-16P) 6 EA $ 1,625.00 $ 9,750.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 1,354.62 $ 8,127.72 $ 1,149.75 $ 6,898.50
6 24" "Hymax Coupling (Part # 860-56-0624-16P) 4 EA $ 2,195.00 $ 8,780.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 1,832.62 $ 7,330.48 $ 1,461.15 $ 5,844.60
7 6” Romac Alpha Restraint Coupling Part #ALPHA-A - 7.00 40 EA $ 550.00 $ 22,000.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 451.47 $ 18,058.80 $ 463.68 $ 18,547.20
8 ”Romac Alpha Restraint Coupling Part #ALPHA-A - 9.10 10 $ 675.00 $ 6,750.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 583.12 $ 5,831.20 $ 598.88 $ 5,988.80
Section "C" TOTAL $ 120,300.00 INCOMPLETE BID $ 102,752.12 $ 91,478.10
SECTION D EST.QTY UOM UNITBIDPRICE AMOUNT BID UNIT BID PRICE AMOUNT BID UNIT BID PRICE AMOUNT BID UNIT BID PRICE AMOUNT BID
1 3/4” Polypropylene 300 LF $ 050 $ 150.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 039 $ 117.00 $ 040 $ 120.00
2 1" Polypropylene with tracer wire 1800 LF $ - $ - INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 154 $ 2,772.00 $ 150 $ 2,700.00
3 2" Polypropylene 200 LF $ 1.95 §$ 390.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 211 $ 422.00 $ 200 $ 400.00
4 1” Polypropylene 600 LF $ 075 $ 450.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 061 $ 366.00 $ 067 $ 402.00
5 1” Polypropylene Inserts 1000 LF $ 2.00 $ 2,000.00 INCOMPLETE BID INCOMPLETE BID $ 221 $ 2,210.00 $ 0.97 $ 970.00
Section "D" TOTAL $ 2,990.00 INCOMPLETE BID $ 5,887.00 $ 4,592.00



Section "A" TOTAL
Section "B" TOTAL
Section "C" TOTAL
Section "D" TOTAL
GRAND TOTAL

North Richland Hills

NRKH

24-025

WATER & WASTEWATER REPAIR MATERIAL

2:00PM (CST) TUESDAY, JUNE 25,2024

$ - NO BID $ INCOMPLETE BID $ $ 295,122.88 $ $  246,615.02
$ - $ 418,929.44 $ INCOMPLETE BID $ $  449,957.19 $ $  296,448.86
$ - $ 120,300.00 $ INCOMPLETE BID $ $  102,752.12 $ $ 91,478.10
$ - $ 2,990.00 $ INCOMPLETE BID $ $ 5,887.00 $ $ 4,592.00
$ - $ 542,219.44 INCOMPLETE BID $ $ 853,719.19 $ $ 639,133.98
Cra /éanwwg Kiomara Qbacd
Purchasing Manager Buyer

Bid Tabulation Statement

All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet. However, the listing of a bid on this sheet should not be construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that the city accepts such
bid as responsive. The city will make a determination as to the responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, City of North Richland Hills guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the

project specifications and contract documents. The City will notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.
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