



COMMISSIONERS COURT
COMMUNICATION

REFERENCE NUMBER 128518

PAGE 1 OF 11

DATE: 9/11/2018

SUBJECT: **BID NO. 2018-165 – ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING PRODUCTS – ALL PRECINCTS – VARIOUS VENDORS - PER UNIT PRICE AND DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE**

COMMISSIONERS COURT ACTION REQUESTED:

It is requested that the Commissioners Court award Bid No. 2018-165, Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products, for all Precincts, to the following vendors at the per unit price and discount from list price:




- Primary Austin Asphalt, Inc.
- JLB Contracting, LLC
- The Lane Construction Corporation
- Reynolds Asphalt and Construction Company
- TexasBit
- Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC

BACKGROUND:

Notice of the County’s intent to bid was advertised in local newspapers, as required by State statute, and posted on the Internet, the Arlington Black Chamber of Commerce, the Fort Worth Hispanic Chamber of Commerce, the Fort Worth Metropolitan Black Chamber of Commerce, and the Tarrant County Asian American Chamber of Commerce. Two hundred twenty-one (221) vendors were contacted and requested to participate in this bid process. All documents pertaining to this bid were posted on the Tarrant County website and were downloaded by interested bidders. Six (6) bids and one (1) no-bid were received.

Bids were evaluated by the four (4) Maintenance Precincts and Purchasing representatives. Primary award recommendations are to all vendors meeting specifications.

The term of the contract is twelve (12) months, effective October 1, 2018, with two (2) options for renewal periods of twelve (12) months each.

SUBMITTED BY:	Purchasing	PREPARED BY:	Brandie Bingham, CPPB
		APPROVED BY:	  



COMMISSIONERS COURT COMMUNICATION

REFERENCE NUMBER: _____ DATE: 9/11/2018 PAGE 2 OF 11

Therefore, it is the joint recommendation of the four (4) Maintenance Precincts and Purchasing that Bid No. 2018-165, Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products, be awarded to the vendors listed above at the per unit price and discount from list price.

FISCAL IMPACT:

Expenses from last year are approximately \$2,075,600.00. Orders are placed on an as-needed basis.

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED USAGE IN TONS	Austin Asphalt, Inc. Irving, TX		JLB Contracting, LLC Fort Worth, TX	
			HUB - NO Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	COOP - YES Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered	HUB - NO Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	COOP - YES Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered
SECTION I - VIRGIN AGGREGATE MATERIAL						
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete						
1	Type B; Fine Graded Intermediate Base Course	5,500	\$61.00	\$71.50	\$58.00	\$64.85
2	Type C; Coarse Graded Surface Course	60	\$63.75	\$74.25	No Bid	No Bid
3	Type D; Fine Graded Surface Course	40,000	\$64.75	\$75.25	\$58.00	\$64.85
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete, Cold Laid						
4	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Concrete						
8	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	\$61.00	\$71.50	No Bid	No Bid
9	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	\$64.00	\$74.50	No Bid	No Bid
10	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$65.00	\$75.50	No Bid	No Bid
11	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Patching Material						
12	High Performance Cold Mix Patching Material	60	No Bid	No Bid	\$100.00	\$105.00

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED USAGE IN TONS	The Lane Construction Corporation Roanoke, TX		Reynolds Asphalt and Construction Company Eules, TX	
			HUB - NO Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	COOP - YES Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered	HUB - NO Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	COOP - YES Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered
SECTION I - VIRGIN AGGREGATE MATERIAL						
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete						
1	Type B; Fine Graded Intermediate Base Course	5,500	\$50.75	No Bid	\$56.00	Varies with Mileage
2	Type C; Coarse Graded Surface Course	60	\$58.00	No Bid	\$61.00	Varies with Mileage
3	Type D; Fine Graded Surface Course	40,000	\$62.00	No Bid	\$61.00	Varies with Mileage
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete, Cold Laid						
4	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Concrete						
8	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	\$50.75	No Bid	\$56.00	Varies with Mileage
9	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	\$58.00	No Bid	\$61.00	Varies with Mileage
10	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$62.00	No Bid	\$61.00	Varies with Mileage
11	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	\$62.00	Varies with Mileage
Patching Material						
12	High Performance Cold Mix Patching Material	60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED USAGE IN TONS	TexasBit Irving, TX		Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC San Antonio, TX	
			HUB - NO Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	COOP - YES Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered	HUB - NO Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	COOP - YES Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered
SECTION I - VIRGIN AGGREGATE MATERIAL						
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete						
1	Type B; Fine Graded Intermediate Base Course	5,500	\$54.00	Varies with Milage	\$58.00	\$70.50
2	Type C; Coarse Graded Surface Course	60	\$58.00	Varies with Milage	\$58.00	\$70.50
3	Type D; Fine Graded Surface Course	40,000	\$57.00	Varies with Milage	\$57.00	\$69.50
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete, Cold Laid						
4	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$80.00	Varies with Milage	\$70.00	No Bid
7	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Concrete						
8	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	\$56.00	Varies with Milage	\$61.00	\$73.50
9	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	\$60.00	Varies with Milage	\$61.00	\$73.50
10	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$59.00	Varies with Milage	\$60.00	\$72.50
11	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Patching Material						
12	High Performance Cold Mix Patching Material	60	\$97.00	Varies with Milage	No Bid	No Bid

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED USAGE IN TONS	Austin Asphalt, Inc. Irving, TX		JLB Contracting, LLC Fort Worth, TX	
			HUB - NO Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	COOP - YES Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered	HUB - NO Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	COOP - YES Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered
SECTION II - FRACTIONATED RAP MATERIAL						
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete						
13	Type B; Fine Graded Intermediate Base Course	16,000	\$53.00	\$63.50	No Bid	No Bid
14	Type C; Coarse Graded Surface Course	0 - Minimal Tons	\$56.00	\$66.50	No Bid	No Bid
15	Type D; Fine Graded Surface Course	20,000	\$57.00	\$57.50	No Bid	No Bid
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete, Cold Laid						
16	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Concrete						
20	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	\$53.00	\$63.50	No Bid	No Bid
21	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	\$56.00	\$66.50	No Bid	No Bid
22	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$57.00	\$67.50	No Bid	No Bid
23	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Patching Material						
24	High Performance Cold Mix Patching Material	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED USAGE IN TONS	The Lane Construction Corporation Roanoke, TX		Reynolds Asphalt and Construction Company Eules, TX	
			HUB - NO Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	COOP - YES Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered	HUB - NO Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	COOP - YES Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered
SECTION II - FRACTIONATED RAP MATERIAL						
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete						
13	Type B; Fine Graded Intermediate Base Course	16,000	\$48.00	No Bid	\$51.00	Varies with Milage
14	Type C; Coarse Graded Surface Course	0 - Minimal Tons	\$49.25	No Bid	\$56.00	Varies with Milage
15	Type D; Fine Graded Surface Course	20,000	\$53.00	No Bid	\$56.00	Varies with Milage
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete, Cold Laid						
16	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Concrete						
20	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	\$48.00	No Bid	\$51.00	Varies with Milage
21	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	\$49.25	No Bid	\$56.00	Varies with Milage
22	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$53.00	No Bid	\$56.00	Varies with Milage
23	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Patching Material						
24	High Performance Cold Mix Patching Material	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED USAGE IN TONS	TexasBit Irving, TX		Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC San Antonio, TX	
			HUB - NO	COOP - YES	HUB - NO	COOP - YES
SECTION II - FRACTIONATED RAP MATERIAL						
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete						
13	Type B; Fine Graded Intermediate Base Course	16,000	\$45.00	Varies with Milage	\$56.00	No Bid
14	Type C; Coarse Graded Surface Course	0 - Minimal Tons	\$49.00	Varies with Milage	\$56.00	No Bid
15	Type D; Fine Graded Surface Course	20,000	\$50.00	Varies with Milage	\$55.00	No Bid
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete, Cold Laid						
16	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	\$68.00	No Bid
19	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Concrete						
20	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	\$46.00	Varies with Milage	\$59.00	\$71.50
21	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	\$50.00	Varies with Milage	\$59.00	\$71.50
22	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$51.00	Varies with Milage	\$58.00	\$70.50
23	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Patching Material						
24	High Performance Cold Mix Patching Material	0 - Minimal Tons	\$97.00	Varies with Milage	No Bid	No Bid

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	Austin Asphalt, Inc. Irving, TX		JLB Contracting, LLC Worth, TX		The Lane Construction Corporation Roanoke, TX	
		HUB - NO	COOP - YES	HUB - NO	COOP - YES	HUB - NO	COOP - YES
		Tandem Truck Ton/Mile	Flowboy Ton/Mile	Tandem Truck Ton/Mile	Flowboy Ton/Mile	Tandem Truck Ton/Mile	Flowboy Ton/Mile
25	Delivery Charge Per Mile F.O.B. Precinct Garage/Jobsite	\$0.45	\$0.45	\$6.85	\$6.85	No Bid	No Bid
26	Minimum Delivery Charge	\$350.00 /12 Load		\$50.00/hour		No Bid	No Bid
27	Demurrage Charge Per Hour	\$100.00		\$50.00		No Bid	No Bid
28	Discount for Related Items No Specified	0.00%		N/A		No Bid	No Bid
	Plant Location(s)	2301 Austin Rd Fort Worth, TX 76118		7151 Randol Mill Rd. Fort Worth, TX 76124		11801 Harmonson Rd. Justin, TX 76247	

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	Reynolds Asphalt and Construction Company Eules, TX		TexasBit Irving, TX		Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC San Antonio, TX	
		HUB - NO Tandem Truck Ton/Mile	COOP - YES Flowboy Ton/Mile	HUB - NO Tandem Truck Ton/Mile	COOP - YES Flowboy Ton/Mile	HUB - NO Tandem Truck Ton/Mile	COOP - YES Flowboy Ton/Mile
25	Delivery Charge Per Mile F.O.B. Precinct Garage/Jobsite	\$5.65	\$4.90	\$0.60	\$0.50	N/A	\$0.25
26	Minimum Delivery Charge	12 ton	21 ton	\$6.00		\$275.00	
27	Demurrage Charge Per Hour	\$33.25	\$47.95	\$100.00		\$90.00	
28	Discount for Related Items No Specified	0.00%		No Bid			
	Plant Location(s)	12650 Calloway Cemetery Rd. Eules, TX 76040		1901 Cold Springs Rd. Fort Worth, TX 76102		1111 Gilbert Pit Rd. Millsap, TX 76066	
		10015 Hicks Field Rd. Saginaw, TX 76179		9500 Technology Blvd. Fort Worth, TX 76104			
		617 E. College St. Lewisville, TX 75057		12299 Camp Bowie Blvd. Aledo, TX 76008			



TAKINGS IMPACT ASSESSMENT CHECKLIST

Complete this form for any county action that involves the adoption of a regulation, policy, guideline, court resolution, or order.

Project/Regulation Name: Bid No. 2018-165, Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

County Department: PURCHASING

Contact Person: Jack Beacham, C.P.M., A.P.P.

Phone Number for Contact Person: (817) 884-1133

Type of TIA Performed: SHORT TIA or FULL TIA. Circle one after answering the questions in Sections II and III below.

I. Stated Purpose

Attach to this checklist an explanation of the purpose of the regulation, policy, guideline, court resolution or order.

Note: The remainder of this Takings Impact Assessment Checklist should be completed in consultation with the Criminal District Attorney's Office.

II. Potential Effect on Private Real Property

1. Does the county action require a physical invasion, occupation or dedication of real property?

Yes _____ No √

2. Does the county action limit or restrict a real property right, even partially or temporarily?

Yes _____ No √

If you answered yes to either question, go to Section III. If you answered no to both, STOP HERE and circle SHORT TIA at the top of the form.
