North Richland Hills
NKRKRH

RFP 23-023

UNIVERSAL POWER SUPPLY (UPS) EQUIPMENT SERVICE CONTRACT - BID TAB
2:00:00 PM July 27, 2023

VENDORS

Quantity

DRISCOLL AUTOMATIC

HYPERTEC

APC UPS SYSTEMS

(2) WADVULTRA-PX-41

APC Schneider Electric- Advantage
Ultra Plan

1 Year — Symmetra PX 100K and or
PDU

7X24 PM Visit

Covers Model (2) APC PX100 KVA
SYCF110KF

Serial #’s

PD1447150089

PD1447150091

TOTALS

7,135.00

$ 14,270.00

7,429.06 | $

14,858.12

(2) WUPG4HR7X24-UG-02

1 Year 4HR 7X24 Response Upgrade to
or Existing Service Contract for 41 to
Covers Model (2) APC PX100 KVA
Serial #’s

PD1447150089

PD1447150091

TOTALS

1,098.00

2,196.00

1,204.96 | $

2,409.92

(2) WADVULTRA-PX-38
APC Schneider Electric- Advantage
Ultra Plan




1 Year — Symmetra PX 80K and or
PDU

7X24 PM Visit

Covers Model (2) APC PX100 KVA
SYCF110KF

Serial #’s

PD1507350114

PD1507350107

TOTALS

6,212.00

$

12,424.00

6,470.47

$

12,940.94

(2) WUPG4HR7X24-UG-02

1 Year 4HR 7X24 Response Upgrade to
Factory Warranty

or Existing Service Contract for 41 to
150 kVA

Covers Model (2) APC PX100 KVA
SYCF110KF

Serial #’s

PD1507350114

PD1507350107

TOTALS

1,089.00

$

2,178.00

1,204.96

2,409.92

(4) WULTRABAT-PX-B2
APC — Advantage Ultra Battery Plan
1 — Year — Symmetra PX 80-100
External Battery Frame

Covers Model (2) APC PX100
SYCFXR9

Serial #’s

PD1440250029

PD1448150015

PD1517350077

PD1526150057

TOTALS

4,294.00

$

17,176.00

4,522.86

$

18,091.44

(4) WADVUPTRA-AX-26
APC Schneider Electric — Advantage
Ultra Plan




In-Row RC Chilled Water Cooling
Units

The APC Cooling Units:

Model (4) ACRC301S

Serial #
JK1522006494
JK1522006490
JK1522006498
JK1522006485

TOTALS

2,303.00

$

9,212.00

2,396.46

9,585.84

(4) WUPG8HR7X24-AX-00
1 — Year 8 Hr 7X24 Response to
existing service

Contract for Cooling Products
The APC Cooling Units:
Model (4) ACRC301S

Serial #

JK1522006494
JK1522006490
JK1522006498
JK1522006485

TOTALS

386.00

$

1,544.00

428.19

1,712.76

EATON UPS SYSTEMS

Fire Station #5 - 7202 Dick Fisher Dr.
North.

Model # 9PX11KPM

Serial# P211L.17921

Order Code

FLN71XXX-1800 UN
0005NXXX-1800UN
EBN71XXX-4999BN

TOTALS

1,094.00

$

3,282.00

NO BID

NO BID

Fire Station #5 - 7202 Dick Fisher Dr.
North

Model # FE18KVA

Serial # EY332FNO006




Order Code
FLN71XXX-1800 UN
0005NXXX-1800UN
EBN71XXX-4999BN

TOTALS

944.67

$

2,834.00

NO BID

NO BID

Fire Station #5 - 7202 Dick Fisher Dr.

North

Model # FE18KVA
Serial # BM162FNO015
Order Code
FLN71XXX-1800 UN
0005NXXX-1800UN
EBN71XXX-4999BN

TOTALS

944.67

$

2,834.00

NO BID

NO BID

FD/PD Training - 7202 Dick Fisher
Dr. North

Model # 9170+660C120AAAAAAL

Serial # BC515T0011
Order Code
FLN71XXX-1800 UN
0005NXXX-1800UN

TOTALS

1,262.00

$

2,524.00

NO BID

NO BID

FD/PD Training - 7202 Dick Fisher
Dr. North

Model # 9170+660C120AAAAAAL

Serial # BE203T0015
Order Code
FLN71XXX-1800 UN
0005NXXX-1800UN

TOTALS

1,262.00

$

2,524.00

NO BID

NO BID

Public Library - 9015 Grand Ave.
Model #
FE12.5K+FM340AA0A0A0B
Serial # BF212FMO001




Order Code
FLN71XXX-1800 UN
0005NXXX-1800UN
EBN71XXX-4999BN

TOTALS

944.67

2,834.00

NO BID

NO BID

City Hall / Public Safety - 4301 City
Point Dr.

Model # PW9170-6

Serial # C6661N000H047831

Order Code

FLN71XXX-1800 UN
0005NXXX-1800UN

TOTALS

1,104.50

2,209.00

NO BID

NO BID

APC UPS Systems Sub-Total:

59,000.00

59,000.00 | $

62,008.94

62,008.94

Eaton UPS Systems Sub-Total:
Cyber Insurance
Performance and Payment Bonds

19,041.00

19,041.00

NO BID

NO BID

L I

2,307.00

| A

2,307.00

62,008.94

&+ H

62,008.94

Proposed Service Contract Grand Total:

& ||e|e|e

80,348.00

&p |||l

80,348.00

124,017.88

124,017.88

Purchasing Manager

Buyer

""Bid Tabulation Statement"

All bids submitted for the designated project are reflected on this bid tab sheet. However, the listing of a bid on this sheet should not be
construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid or as any indication that the city accepts such bid as responsive. The city will
make a determination as to the responsiveness of bids submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, City of North Richland
Hills guidelines, and project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents. The City will
notify the successful bidder upon award of the contract and, according to law, all bids received will be available for inspection at that time.




